Date:14-07-2025
To

The Principal
Canara Engincering College
Sudhindra Nagura. Benjanapadavu

Through.

The Vice Principal/Dean Academics
Canara Eng/inecring College

[he Dean Administration
Canara Engincering College

The Convener
Library Advisory Commitiee

I'he Chairman
Library Advisory Committee

Respecied Sir.

Sub: Requesting for Printing of Library Borrowers Card and Plastic Covers for 1* Year BE
Students for the Academic Year 2025-26-reg
Ref: Quotation Dated 07-07-2025

With reference to the above. we require the printing of Library Borrowers Card and Plastic Covers
for First year BE Students for the Academic year 2025-26. As per the rates quoted by the M/S
Mangalore Trading Association. Mangalore, the total amount for printing the Borrowers card and
Plastic covers is Rupees 13, 688/-. | Kindly request you to approve the same.

Thanking you.
Yours faithfully

W

Librarian jul? | er‘ﬂ"“{
Encl: Statement and Quotation
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CANARA ENGINEERING C( JLILEGE
LA WE PR Flantwal, Taluk
Miangalura Lataka 5 315

Library and Information Centre '

Date:14-07-2025
The following rates have been quoted by the vendor for the printing and supply of stationery materials to
our College Library
Work Name:Printing of Library Borrowers Card and Plastic Covers Vendor
Description M/S Mangalore Trading Asociation Private Limited
Si.No. Title Quantity Unit Price Total(in Rs)
1 Library Borrowers Card 2000 No's 0.80 ( Paisa) 1600
3 Plastic Covers 2000 No's 5.00 (Rs) 10000
GST 18% Extra 2088
Total Amount in Rupees 13688

The above general guotation is for Printing a

nd supply of Library Borrowers card and Plastic Covers for Fist year BE Students for the
Acdemic Year 2025-26

Forwarded for further guidelines
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Librarian Chairman Convener Dean Administration Vice P Principal

Library Advisory Committee Library Advisory Committee (4}(



% 7/8/25, 9:33 AM ‘ Canara Engineering College Mail - Fwd:

Library CEC <library@canaraengineering.in>

Fwd:

1 message

Canara Engineering college CEC <canarait@gmail.com> Mon, Jul 7, 2025 at 12:42 PM
To: aocec@canaraengineering.in
Cc: Library CEC <library@canaraengineering.in>

Dr. Nagesh H R

Principal

Canara Engineering College
Sudhindra Nagara, Benjanapadavu
Mangaluru- 574 219

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: sharadapress 1900 < ' i >
Date: Mon, Jul 7, 2025 at 12:14 PM

Stibject:

Te: = ! >

Quotation

2000 library borrowers card Rs 1600

2000 plastic pouch Rs 10000

Gst 18% extra

Total Rs 13688/-

FROM

THE MAI. JALORE TRADING ASSOCIATION PVT LTD
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hitps://mail.google com/maii/u/0/?ik=3695bdei8f&view=pt&securch=alldpernthid=thread-f: 183697 1266743622504& simpl=msg-f:1836971286743622504
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